GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

ITEM I (150) 50 KVA PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER, STK # 205140

SEPTEMBER 13, 2022 @ 3:00 PM

DELIVERY UNIT OWNERSHIP TOTAL
VENDORS TIME PRICE COST/UNIT
(WKS)
Alpha Plotter, LLC. 25 $5,410.00 $7,509.70* $811,500.00
Richardson & Associates 60 7,113.00 9,006.00 1,066,950.00

Wesco Distribution, Inc. (N0 BID)

WEG Transformers USA (NO BID)

Delta Star, Inc. (NO BID)

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total ownership cost.

22-55




GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

ITEM Il (30) 25 KVA CONV 120/240 TRANSFORMER, STK # 204900

SEPTEMBER 13, 2022 @ 3:00 PM

DELIVERY UNIT OWNERSHIP TOTAL
VENDORS TIME PRICE COST/UNIT
(WKS)
Richardson & Associates 60* $2,872.00 $4,011.00 $86,160.00
Wesco Distribution, Inc. 142 2,210.00 2,490.80 71,880.00

Alpha Plotter, LLC. (NO BID)

WEG Transformers USA (NO BID)

Delta Star, Inc. (NO BID)

* Indicates recommended award based on shortest delivery time.

22-55




GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

ITEM Il (75) 15 KVA CSP 7200V TRANSFORMER, STK # 205010

SEPTEMBER 13, 2022 @ 3:00 PM

DELIVERY UNIT OWNERSHIP TOTAL

VENDORS TIME PRICE COST/UNIT

(WKS)
Richardson & Associates 60* $2,724.00 $3,520.80 $204,300.00
Wesco Distribution, Inc. 142 2,210.00 2,992.70 165,750.00

Alpha Plotter, LLC. (NO BID)

WEG Transformers USA (NO BID)

Delta Star, Inc. (NO BID)

* Indicates recommended award based on shortest delivery time.

22-55



GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

ITEM IV (75) 25 KVA CSP 7200V TRANSFORMER, STK # 205020

SEPTEMBER 13, 2022 @ 3:00 PM

DELIVERY UNIT OWNERSHIP TOTAL

VENDORS TIME PRICE COST/UNIT

(WKS)
Richardson & Associates 60* $3,279.00 $4,462.80 $245,925.00
Wesco Distribution, Inc. 142 2,632.00 3,796.60 197,400.00

Alpha Plotter, LLC. (NO BID)

WEG Transformers USA (NO BID)

Delta Star, Inc. (NO BID)

* Indicates recommended award based on shortest delivery time.

22-55



GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

ITEM V (25) 50 KVA CSP 7200V TRANSFORMER, STK # 205050

SEPTEMBER 13, 2022 @ 3:00 PM

DELIVERY UNIT OWNERSHIP TOTAL

VENDORS TIME PRICE COST/UNIT
(WKS)
Richardson & Associates 60 $4,830.00 $6,865.20* $120,750.00

Wesco Distribution, Inc. (NO BID)

Alpha Plotter, LLC. (NO BID)

WEG Transformers USA (NO BID)

Delta Star, Inc. (NO BID)

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total ownership cost.

22-55



GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

ITEM VI (50) 75 KVA PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER, STK # 205040

SEPTEMBER 13, 2022 @ 3:00 PM

DELIVERY UNIT OWNERSHIP TOTAL

VENDORS TIME PRICE COST/UNIT

(WKS)
Alpha Plotter, LLC. 25* $6,080.00 $10,889.00 $304,000.00
Richardson & Associates 60 7,653.00 10,199.70 382,650.00

Wesco Distribution, Inc. (N0 BID)

WEG Transformers USA (NO BID)

Delta Star, Inc. (NO BID)

* Indicates recommended award based on shortest delivery time.

22-55



GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

ITEM VII (150) 25 KVA PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER, STK # 207860

SEPTEMBER 13, 2022 @ 3:00 PM

DELIVERY UNIT OWNERSHIP TOTAL
VENDORS TIME PRICE COST/UNIT
(WKS)
Alpha Plotter, LLC. 25* $4,848.00 $6,123.00 $727,200.00
Richardson & Associates 60 4,358.00 5,475.20 653,700.00
Wesco Distribution, Inc. 185 4,586.00 5,713.70 687,900.00

WEG Transformers USA (NO BID)

Delta Star, Inc. (NO BID)

* Indicates recommended award based on shortest delivery time.

22-55




GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

ITEM VIII (20) 100 KVA PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER, STK # 205130

SEPTEMBER 13, 2022 @ 3:00 PM

DELIVERY UNIT OWNERSHIP TOTAL

VENDORS TIME PRICE COST/UNIT

(WKS)
Alpha Plotter, LLC. 25 $6,603.00 | $12,534.00* $132,060.00
Richardson & Associates 60 9,427.00 12,667.00 188,540.00

Wesco Distribution, Inc. (N0 BID)

WEG Transformers USA (NO BID)

Delta Star, Inc. (NO BID)

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total ownership cost.

22-55



GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

ITEM IX (2) 1,000 KVA PAD MOUNT 120/208 TRANSFORMER, STK # 206291

SEPTEMBER 13, 2022 @ 3:00 PM

DELIVERY UNIT OWNERSHIP TOTAL
VENDORS TIME PRICE COST/UNIT
(WKS)
Delta Star, Inc. 35* $50,683.00 N/A $101,366.00
Richardson & Associates 60 67,270.00 91,605.10 134,540.00
WEG Transformers USA 86 68,472.00 93,252.00 136,944.00
Wesco Distribution, Inc. 107 81,033.00 105,011.70 162,066.00

Alpha Plotter, LLC. (No BID)

* Indicates recommended award based on shortest delivery time.

22-55




GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

ITEM X (20) 15 KVA CONV. 120/240 TRANSFORMER, STK # 208320

SEPTEMBER 13, 2022 @ 3:00 PM

DELIVERY UNIT OWNERSHIP TOTAL
VENDORS TIME PRICE COST/UNIT
(WKS)
Richardson & Associates 60* $2,518.00 $3,303.70 $50,360.00
Wesco Distribution, Inc. 142 2,030.00 2,854.00 40,600.00

Alpha Plotter, LLC. (NO BID)

WEG Transformers USA (NO BID)

Delta Star, Inc. (NO BID)

* Indicates recommended award based on shortest delivery time.

22-55




GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

ITEM XI (30) 50 KVA CONV. 120/240 TRANSFORMER, STK # 204930

SEPTEMBER 13, 2022 @ 3:00 PM

DELIVERY UNIT OWNERSHIP TOTAL

VENDORS TIME PRICE COST/UNIT
(WKS)
Richardson & Associates 60 $5,299.00 $7,252.30* $158,970.00

Wesco Distribution, Inc. (NO BID)

Alpha Plotter, LLC. (NO BID)

WEG Transformers USA (NO BID)

Delta Star, Inc. (NO BID)

* Indicates recommended award based on lowest total ownership cost.

22-55



GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

ITEM XII (8) 75 KVA PAD 120/208 TRANSFORMER, STK # 205160

SEPTEMBER 13, 2022 @ 3:00 PM

DELIVERY UNIT OWNERSHIP TOTAL

VENDORS TIME PRICE COST/UNIT
(WKS)

Richardson & Associates 40* $14,985.00 $18,155.40 | $119,880.00
WEG Transformers USA 86 14,746.00 17,890.00 117,968.00
Wesco Distribution, Inc. 74 20,076.00 22,897.80 160,608.00
Alpha Plotter, LLC. (N0 BID)
Delta Star, Inc. (NO BID)

* Indicates recommended award based on shortest delivery time.

22-55



GREENVILLE UTILITIES COMMISSION

TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

SEPTEMBER 13, 2022 @ 3:00 PM

ITEM XIlI (3) 150 KVA PAD 120/208 TRANSFORMER, STK # 205220

DELIVERY UNIT OWNERSHIP TOTAL
VENDORS TIME PRICE COST/UNIT
(WKS)
Delta Star, Inc. 35* $17,828.00 N/A $53,484.00
WEG Transformers USA 86 18,265.00 23,732.20 54,795.00
Richardson & Associates 40 19,666.00 25,172.80 58,998.00
Wesco Distribution, Inc. 74 22,685.00 27,788.90 68,055.00

Alpha Plotter, LLC. (No BID)

* Indicates recommended award based on shortest delivery time.

22-55




